BRIGHTON & HOVE CITY COUNCIL
ROAD TRAFFIC REGULATION ACT 1984

BRIGHTON & HOVE (WAITING & LOADING/UNLOADING
RESTRICTIONS AND PARKING PLACES) CONSOLIDATION ORDER 2008
AMENDMENT ORDER No.6 201 |

Brighton & Hove City Council in exercise of its powers under Sections |, 2, 3, 4, 19, 32,
35, 35A, 43, 44, 45, 46, 46A, 47, 49, 51, 53, 55, 61, 63, 63A, 66, 1 17 and 124 (1) (c) & (d)
to the Road Traffic Regulation Act 1984 (“the 1984 Act”) as amended and Part 6 of the
Traffic Management Act 2004 and of all other enabling powers after consultation with the
Chief Officer of Police in accordance with Part Il of Schedule 9 to thel984 Act hereby
makes the above named Order.

The provisions of this Order will come into operation on the |* day of May 2011 and
amends the Brighton & Hove (Waiting & Loading/Unloading Restrictions and Parking
Places) Consolidation Order 2008, as amended, as follows:

SCHEDULE | AMENDMENTS:

Part 1.1 No Waiting At Any Time
Add new item |6a: Access Road to VWhite Horse Hotel — East Side — From the southern
kerbline of Marine Drive southwards for a distance of |5 metres

Add new item [6b: Access Road to White Morse Hotel — West side ~ From the
southern kerbline of Marine Drive southwards for a distance of 9 metres

Amend item 21| Bishops Road: delete “Both sides” and substitute “East side”

Add new item 2] |a: Bishops Road — VWest side — From the northern kerbline of Hove
Park Road northwards to the southern kerbline of The Droveway

Add new item 247a: Braybon Avenue — West side — From the northern kerbline of Old
Court Close northwards for a distance of 10 metres

Add new item 247b: Braybon Avenue — West side ~ From the southern kerbline of Old
Court Close southwards for a distance of |0 metres

Amend item 275 Broomfield Drive: delete |0 metres” and substitute * |4 metres”
Amend itern 2B6 Bush Farm Drive: delete *10 metres” and substitute 15 metres”
Amend item 287 Bush Farm Drive: delete “10 metres” and substitute |5 metres”
Amend item 288 Bush Farm Drive: delete “28 metres” and substitute “33 metres”
Amend item 289 Bush Farm Drive: delete “33 metres” and substitufe “34 metres”

Amend item 339 Chafky Road: delete “Both sides” and substitute “"MNorth side”, delete
“15 metres” and substitute 16 metres”



Add new item 33%a: Chalky Road - South side — From the eastern kerbline of Mile Qak
Road eastwards for a distance of |4 metres

Add new item 339b: Chalky Road — South side — From the western kerbline of Valley
Road to the eastern kerbline of Wickhurst Rise

Amend item 340 Chalky Road: delete existing description and substitute “From the
western kerbline of Beech Close westwards for a distance of 8 metres”

Add new item 340a: Chalky Road — North side — From the eastern kerbline of Beech
Close eastwards for a distance of 6 metres

Amend item 341 Chalky Road: delete 10 metres” and substitute “| | metres”
Amend item 342 Chalky Road: insert “South” in between “Avenue” and “east”
Amend item 345 Chalky Road: delete “13.7 metres” and substitute |5 metres”
Amend item 346 Chalky Road: delete “83 metres” and substitute “84 metres”
Delete item 347: Chalky Road

Amend item 348 Chalky Road: delete “43.5 metres” and substitute “54 metres”
Delete itemn 349: Chalky Road

Add new item 349: Chalky Road — North side — From the eastern kerbline of Graham
Avenue eastwards to the western kerbline of College Close.

Delete item 350: Chalky Road

Delete item 35| Chalky Road

Delete item 352 Chalky Road

Delete item 354 Chalky Road

Delete item 356 Chalky Road

Amend item 357 Chalky Road: delete existing description and substitute “From a point
64 metres east of the eastern kerbline of College Close eastwards for a distance of 95.5
metres”

Delete item 358: Chalky Road

Delete item 35%: Chalky Road

Delete item 360: Challky Road



Amend item 361 Chalky Road: delete existing description and substitute “From a point
43 metres west of the prolongation of the western kerbline of Broomfield Drive
westwards for a distance of | |4 metres"

Amend item 363 Chalky Road: delete “15 metres” and substitute” 17.5 metres”

Amend item 364 Chalky Road: delete “10 metres” and substitute “'10.5 metres”

Amend item 365 Chalky Road: delete “east to its junction with Fox Way (in line with the
eastern kerbline of Thornhill Rise)” and substitute “eastwards for a distance of 64
metres”’

Amend item 366 Chalky Road: delete “20 metres™ and substitute “21 metres”

Amend item 367 Chalky Road: delete “east to its junction with Fox Way” and substitute
“eastwards for a distance of [0 metres”

Amend item 419 College Close: delete “10 metres” and substitute “13 metres”

Amend item 444c County Oak Avenue: delete “180 metres” and substitute “200 metres”
Amend item 549b Denton Drive: delete *30 metres” and substitute ‘10 metres”

Amend item 638a Dyke Road: delete “14 metres” and substitute “38 metres”

Add new item 645c: Dyke Road — East side — From the boundary of Nos. 326 & 328
northwards for a distance of 24 metres

Amend item 848 Foredown Road: delete “15 metres” and substitute "' 16 metres”
Amend item 849 Foredown Road: delete “Both sides” and substitute “West side”

Add new item 849a: Foredown Road — East side — From the northern kerbline of Fox
Way northwards for a distance of 16 metres

Amend item 850 Foredown Road: delete “Both sides” and substitute “West side”
Amend item 857 Fox Way: delete “west for 27 metres and from the eastern kerbline of
Hangleton Lane east for |5 metres” and substitute “westwards for a distance of 68

metres’”’

Delete item 858: Fox Way

Amend item 859 Fox YVay: delete “a point 30 metres east of *, insert “(eastern arm)”
between “Drive” and “eastwards"

Delete item 861: Fox Way
Delete item 862: Fox Way

Amend item 863 Fox Way: delete “70 metres” and substitute “67 metres”



Amend item 864 Fox Way: delete “15 metres"'.and substitute “28 metres”
Delete item 865: Fox Way
Delete item 866: Fox Way
Delete item 867: Fox Way
Delete item 869: Fox Way

Amend item 870 Fox Way: delete 15 metres” and substitute 16 metres”, delete “59.5
metres’ and substitute 63 metres”

Delete item 871: Fox Way
Amend item 872 Fox Way: delete 20 metres” and substitute “19 metres”
Delete item 874: Fox Way

Amend item 1018 Graham Avenue, Portslade: delete “Both sides” and substitute “East
side”, delete “10 metres” and substitute “| | metres”

Amend item 1019 Graham Avenue, Portslade: delete “a point |0 metres north of”,
delete “53 metres” and substitute “63 metres”

Delete item 1021: Graham Avenue, Portslade

Add new item |041i: Greenfield Crescent — West side — From the southern kerbline of
Wilmington Way southwards for a distance of 10 metres

Add new item 1041j: Greenfield Crescent — East side — From the southern kerbline of
Wilmington Way southwards for a distance of 10 metres

Add new item 1222a: Hillcrest — North side- From the eastern kerbline of Westdene
Drive eastwards for a distance of |0 metres

Add new item 1222b: Hillcrest — North side — From the western kerbline of Fairview
Rise westwards for a distance of |0 metres

Add new item |265a: Hollingdean Street — North side — From the eastern kerbline of
Hollingdean Terrace eastwards for a distance of 5 metres

Add new itemn |1265b: Hollingdean Street — South side ~ From the eastern kerbline of
Hollingdean Terrace eastwards for a distance of 5 metres

Add new item 1266a: Hollingdean Terrace — East side — From the northern kerbline of
Hollingdean Street northwards for a distance of 5 metres

Add new item 1266b: Hollingdean Terrace — East side — From the southern kerbline of
Hollingdean Street southwards for a distance of 5 metres



Add item [415a: Kipling Avenue — South side — From the southern eastern kerbline of
The Ridgway eastwards for a distance of 10 metres

Add new item |614c: Marlow Road — North side — From the eastern kerbline of Reading
Road eastwards for a distance of 10 metres

Add new item 1614d: Marlow Road — North side — From the western kerbline of Peel
Road westwards for a distance of 10 metres

Add new item |614e: Marlow Road — North side — From the eastern kerbline of Peel
Road eastwards for a distance of |0 metres

Amend item 1634 Melbourne Street: delete “Both sides™ and substitute “South side”

Add new item |634a; Melbourne Street — North side ~ From the eastern kerbline of
Lewes Road eastwards for a distance of 33.5 metres

Add new item 1695; Millcroft - North side - From the western lkerbline of Westdene
Drive westwards for a distance of {0 metres

Renumber item 1694a “Millcross Road — South side — From the eastern kerbline of
Foredown Road eastwards for a distance of 23.5 metres” as item 1696

Add new item |697; Mill Rise — South side — From the western kerbline of Westdene
Drive westwards for a distance of 8.5 metres

Add new item 1698; Mill Rise — South side — From the eastern kerbline of Westdene
Drive eastwards for a distance of 7 metres

Amend item 1776 New Barn Close: delete “Both sides” and substitute “VWest side”

Add new item [776a;: New Barn Close — East side ~ From the southern kerbline of Fox
Way southwards for a distance of 3 metres

Amend item 1791 New Church Road: delete *15 metres” and substitute “23 metres”
Amend item 1806 New England Rise: delete “25 metres” and substitute "26 metres”

Renumber item 1830a “Newells Close — East side — From the southern kerbline of
Balsdean Road southwards for a distance of 10 metres” as item 1804a

Renumber item 1830b “Newells Close — West side — From the southern kerbline of
Balsdean Road socuthwards for a distance of 10 metres” as item |804b

Add new item 1892a; Old Court Close — North side — From the western kerbline of
Braybon Avenue westwards for a distance of 10 metres

Add new item 1892b: Old Court Close — South side — From the western kerbline of
Braybon Avenue westwards for a distance of 10 metres



Amend item 933 Orchard Gardens: delete *13.7 metres” and substitute 14 metres”
Delete item 1934: Orchard Gardens

Add new item 1934 Orchard Gardens — North and West side — From a point 14 metres
east of the eastern kerbline of Nevill Road eastwards and northwards to the southern
kerbline of Orchard Road.

Add item 2005a: Peel Road — West side — From the northern kerbline of Marlow Road
northwards for a distance of 10 metres

Add item 2005b: Peel Road — East side — From the northern kerbline of Mariow Road
northwards for a distance of 10 metres

Amend item 2027 Portland Avenue: delete existing side of road and description and
substitute “East side — From the southern kerbline of Portland Road southwards for a
distance of 13 metres”

Add new item 2027a: Portland Avenue — West side — From the southern kerbline of
Portland Road southwards for a distance of |2 metres

Amend item 2043 Portland Road: delete existing description and substitute “From the
eastern kerbline of Portland Avenue eastwards for a distance of 10 metres”

Add new item 2043a: Portland Road — South side — From the western kerbline of
Portland Avenue westwards for a distance of 10 metres

Delete item 2050: Portland Road

Add new item 2050: Portland Road — North side — From the eastern kerbline of the
access road to Portland Business Park eastwards for a distance of 31 metres

Add new item 2075b: Poynings Drive — East side - From the common boundary of Nos.
99 and 101 Poynings Drive southwards for a distance of 16 metres

Add item 2166a: Reading Road — West side — From the northern kerbline of Marlow
Road northwards for a distance of 10 metres

Add item 2166b: Reading Road ~ East side — From the northern kerlbine of Marlow Road
northwards for a distance of 10 metres

Amend item 2250 Rowan Avenue: delete “northwards to a point 10 metres™ and
substitute “northwards to a point 5 metres”

Amend item 2276a St Andrew's Road, Portslade: insert “a point 5.5 metres west of”
between “From” and “the western boundary”, delete 5 metres” and insert “é metres”

Amend item 2334 St Peter’s Road, Portslade: delete “32.5 metres” and substitute *42
metres”, delete “10 metres" and substitute “|3 metres”



Amend item 2335 St Peter’s Road, Portslade: delete "6 metres” and substitute “7
metres”

Amend item 2340 Saltdean Vale: delete “both sides” and substitute “West side”

Add new item 2340a: Saltdean Vale — East side — From the northern kerbline of Arundel
Drive East northwards for a distance of 22.5 metres

Add new item 2340b: Saltdean Vale — East side — From the southern kerbiine of
Chichester Drive East southwards for a distance of |5 metres

Delete item 2474: Springfield Road
Amend item 2475 Springfield Road: delete “13.5 metres” and substitute “36.5 metres”

Add new item 2717a: The Ridgway — East side — From the southern kerbline of Kipling
Avenue southwards for a distance of |0 metres

Amend item 2742 Thornhill Rise: delete *|0 metres” and substitute “| | metres”
Amend item 2743 Thornhill Rise: delete “12 metres” and substitute “[3 metres”
Amend item 2744 Thornhill Rise: delete ““10 metres” and substitute “12 metres”

Amend item 2745 Thornhill Rise: delete existing description and substitute “From the
northern kerbline of New England Rise northwards for a distance of |18 metres

Amend item 2746 Thornhill Way: delete “Both sides” and substitute “South side”

Add new item 2746a: Thornhill Way - North side ~ From the western kerbline of
Thornhill Rise westwards for a distance of 9 metres

Delete item 2845: Valley Road
Amend item 2899 Village Way, Falmer: delete “both sides” and substitute “South side”

Add new item 289%a: Village Way — North side — From a point 188 metres west of its
junction with Falmer Road westwards for a distance of 179 metres

Add new item 2900b: Wadhurst Rise — North side — From the western kerbline of
Wilson Avenue westwards for a distance of 8 metres

Add new item 2900c: Wadhurst Rise — South side — From the western kerbline of
Wilson Avenue westwards for a distance of 8 metres

Delete item 2934; Warrior Close
Amend item 2935 Warrior Close: delete “50 metres’ and substitute “52 metres”

Amend item 2936 Warrior Close: delete “50 metres” and substitute “49 metres”



Add new item 2955a: Westdene Drive — West side — From the northern kerbline of
Millcroft northwards for a distance of 10 metres

Add new item 2955b: Westdene Drive — East side — From the northern kerbline of
Hillerest northwards for a distance of 10 metres

Add new item 2955¢: Westdene Drive — West side — From the southern kerbline of Mill
Rise southwards for a distance of |0 metres

Add new item 2955d: Westdene Drive — East side — From the southern kerbline of Mill
Rise southwards for a distance of 10 metres

Add new item 3015e: Wilmington Way — South side ~ From the western kerbline of
Greenfield Crescent westwards for a distance of 10 metres

Add new item 3015f: Wilmington Way — South side — From the eastern kerbline of
Greenfield Crescent eastwards for a distance of 10 metres

Delate itern 301 7¢: Wilson Avenue — West side — From the northern kerbline of Marlow
Road northwards for a distance of B.5 metres

Delete item 3017d: Wilson Avenue — West side — From the southern kerbline of Marlow
Road southwards for a distance of 12.5 metres

Part [.4 No Waiting Monday to Saturday 8.00 am to 6.00 pm
Add new item 40: Olive Road — East side from a point |4 metres north of the northern
kerbline of Isabel Crescent northwards for a distance of 58 metres

Amend item 66 Victoria Road, Portslade: delete “west of the western kerbline of
Southdown Avenue’ and substitute “east of the eastern kerbline of Access Road into
Caffyns and Volkswagen Showrooms”

Add new item 66a: Victoria Road, Portslade — North side — From a point 33 metres west
of the western kerbiine of Southdown Avenue westwards for a distance of |4 metres

Part 1.6 No Waiting Monday to Saturday 9.00 am to 6.00 pm

Renumber item 7a ** Boundary Road, Hove — East side — From a point 5.8 metres south
of the southern kerbline of Hallyburton Road southwards for a distance of 42.1 metres”
as item 6a

Part 1.13 No Waiting Monday to Friday 9.00am to épm
Renumber existing item | Cranleigh Avenue as item Ia

Part 2.1 No Waiting or Loading at any time
Add new item 2a: Elrington Road — West side ~ From the southern kerbline of The
Droveway southwards for a distance of 5.5 metres

Add new item 5a: Melbourne Street — North side — From the eastern kerbline of Lewes
Road eastwards for a distance of || metres



Add new item 5b: Melbourne Street — South side — From the eastern kerbline of Lewes
Road eastwards for a distance of |3 metres

Renumber existing item 8b The Green, Rottingdean as item 8¢

Add new item 8d: The Droveway — South side — From the western kerbline of Elrington
Road westwards for a distance of 8 metres

Add new item 8e: The Highway — West side — From the northern kerbline of Southall
Avenue northwards for a distance of |15 metres

Part 2.10 No Loading/unloading Monday to Friday 8.30am to 9.30am and 2Zpm
to 4pm
Amend item | County Oak Avenue: delete “180 metres” and substitute “200 metres”

Part 3.1 Clearway At Any Time
Delete item 1: The Highway

Part 3.2 Clearway Monday to Saturday 8am to 2.30am and 4.00pm to 6.00pm
Delete itemn 3: Melbourne Street

Part 4.1 No Stopping on School Keep Clear Zig Zag Markings Monday to
Friday 8.30am -~ 9.30am and 2.00pm - 4.00 pm (except August)
Amend item 40 Ladies Mile Road: delete *55.8 metres” and substitute “68.5 metres”,

delete “4] metres” and substitute *28 metres”

Amend item 4| Ladies Mile Road: delete "16.5 metres” and substitute *5 metres”, delete
“31.56 metres” and substitute “44.5 metres”

Amend item 53 Radinden Manor Road: delete 26 metres” and substitute “28 metres”,
delete “24.56 metres” and substitute “25.56 metre”

Amend item 54 Radinden Manor Road: delete “60.7 metres” and substitute 63 metres”,
delete “56.8 metres” and substitute “28.25 metres”

Add new item 54a: Radinden Manor Road — South side — From a point 92.2 metres north
of the northern kerbline of Old Shoreham Road northwards for a distance of 28.25
metres

Amend item 55 Radinden Manor Road: delete “161.4 metres” and substitute “164.5
metres”, delete “24.56 metres” and substitute “43.56 metres”

Delete item 55a: Radinden Manor Road

Part 5.5 Limited waiting for 1 hour (no return within | hour) Monday to
Saturday 8am to 6pm

Add item 20a: Victoria Road, Portslade — North side — From a point 9 metres west of
the western kerbline of Southdown Avenue westwards for a distance of 24 metres

Add item 20b: Victoria Road, Portslade — North side — From a point 47 metres west of
the western kerbline of Southdown Avenue westwards for a distance of 25 metres



Part 5.9 Limited waiting for 2 hours (no return within | hour) Monday to
Sunday 8am to 8pm '

Renumber item 2 *London Road — West side — From a point 10.9 metres south of the
southern kerbline of access road to The Excelsior southwards for a distance of 34.3
metres” as item 3

Part 5.12 Limited waiting for 2 hours (no return within I hour) Monday to
Saturday 9am to 6pm

Add new item |: Access Road to White Horse Hotel — West side — From a point 9
metres south of the southern kerbline of Marine Drive southwards for a distance of 24
metres

Renumber existing item | Beaconsfield Road as item la

Part 5.13 Limited waiting for 2 hours (no return within 3 hour) Monday to
Saturday 9am to 6pm

Amend item 3 Beaconsfield Road, Brighton: delete *15.7 metres” and substitute “12.7
metres”

Part 6.1 Disabled Parking Bay At Any Time

Delete item 35: Beatty Avenue (outside No.83)

Add new item 35: Beatty Avenue ~ West side — From a point 15 metres south of the
southern side of the footpath between Nos. 87 & 8% Beatty Avenue southwards for a
distance of 5.5 metres (outside No.81)

Delete item 45a: Bevendean Crescent (outside No.29)

Add new item 50c¢: Birdham Road — West side — From a point 46 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Nyetimber Hill northwards for a distance of 6 metres. (outside
No.l}

Renumber item 54¢ “Bonchurch Road — East side ~Froma point 6.6 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Bernard Place northwards for a distance of 5.5 metres (outside
No.44)" as item 54b '

Delete item 68c: Carden Hil! (outside No.84)

Add new item 70a: Chailey Road - South side — From a point 89 metres east of the
prolongation of the eastern kerbline of Newick Road eastwards for a distance of 5.5
metres. (outside No.7)

Delete item 108b: Crespin Way (opposite No.26)

Delete item 162: Down Terrace (outside No.55)

Add new item |79a: Egginton Close — South side — From a point 7 metres east of the

boundary wall between Nos. |9 & 21 Egginton Close eastwards for a distance of 5.5
metres (outside No.l7)

10



Add new item 276: Hartfield Avenue — West side — From a point 3 metres north of the
boundary wall between Nos. 43 & 45 Hartfield Avenue northwards for a distance of 5.5
metres

Amend item 332c Isabel Crescent; delete “5.5 metres” and substitute 6.6 metres”
Delete item 375: Links Road (outside No.26)

Delete item 394: Lyminster Avenue {opposite No.32)

Add new item 432a: Meadow Close — East side — From a point 34 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Easthill Drive northwards for distance of 5.5 metres (opposite
No.}l)

Amend item 433 Meadow Close: delete “49 metres” and substitute “51.5 metres”
Delete item 534d: Queens Park Rise (outside No.75)

Delete item 648a: Stonery Road (outside No.7)

Delete item 691: Vale Road (outside No.72)

Add new ltem 501: Park Crescent, Rottingdean — West side — Extending from a point 43
metres north of the northern kerbline of Park Road northwards for a distance of 5.5
metres (outside No.9)

Delete item 503: Park Crescent Rottingdean (outside No.15)

Delete item 717: Westdene Drive (outside No. 4}

Part 7.1 Solo Motorcycles Parking Bay At Any Time
Renumber existing item | Bear Road as item la

Add new item |: Beaconsfield Road, Brighton — East side — From a point 57.4 metres
south of the southern kerbline of Springfield Road southwards for a distance of 3 metres

Delete item 2: Caledonian Road

Amend item 3 Longridge Avenue: delete “|2.5 metres” and substitute “14 metres”
Amend item 5 Queens Park Road: delete “7.5 metres” and substitute 7 metres”
Amend item 6 Springfield Road: delete “66 metres” and substitute “68 metres”
Amend item 7 Station Road: delete “40 metres north of the northern kerbline” and
substitute “25.5 metres north of the southern kerbline”, delete “9.5 metres” and

substitute "8 metres”

Part 9.3 Car Club Spaces At Any Time (Streetcar)

il



Renumber item 2 “Richmond Parade — South side - From a point 25 metres west of the
western kerbline of Ashton Rise westwards for 5.5 metres” as item 7

Part 10.1 Taxi Rank At Any Time
Add new item 6a: Longridge Avenue — South side — From a point 30 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Marine Drive northwards for a distance of 14.5 metres

Renumber item 8 “Nevill Road (Slip road between Nevill Road and Court Farm Road) —
East side - From a point 5.5 metres south of the southern kerbline of Nevill Road
southwards for a distance of |2 metres™ as item 7

Renumber item 7 "Portland Road — North side — From a point 27.8 metres west of the
western kerbline of Ingram Crescent East westwards for a distance of 15.5 metres” as
item 8

Add new item 10b: The Highway (Opposite No.40 - 50) northeast of the Central
Reservation — South west side — From a point 10.5 metres south of the eastern kerbline
of The Highway southwards for a distance of 16.5 metres

Add new item |0c: Tongdean Lane — West side — From a point 27 metres north of the
northern kerbline of the access road into Withdean Stadium northwards for a distance of

28 metres

Part | 1.6 Loading bay Monday to Friday 8am to épm
Delete item |: St Peter’s Road

Add new item I1: Ditchling Road - East side — From a point 10 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Round Hill Road northwards for a distance of | | metres

Part 11.7 Loading bay waiting restriction to between Monday to Friday 8am
and 5pm

Delete item 2: Ladies Mile Road

Add new item 2: Whitehawk Road — East side — From a point 28.5 metres south of the
southern kerbline of the access road between Ryecroft flats and Westham flats

southwards for a distance of 17 metres

Part 14.1 Police Parking Bay At Any Time
Delete item 2 Islingword Road

Delete ltern 3 St Martin's Place

Delete item 4 Stanford Avenue

12



THE COMMON SEAL OF BRIGHTON & HOVE )
CITY COUNCIL was affixed hereto this /#” day of )

APAI Two Thousand and )
in the presence of

)

Authorised Person

13






